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WITH THE ALL-ROUND CAREFREE SERVICES FROM 
SUNNY CARS ALL NECESSARY INSURANCES ARE 
ALWAYS INCLUDED. 
WORLDWIDE. WITHOUT DEDUCTIBLE.

 Unlimited mileage

 Fully comprehensive insurance with refund of the excess.

 Refund in the event of damage to the glass, roof, tyres and 
underbody, including sump and clutch.

 Refund of towing costs in case of an accident or technical 
issues.

 Refund of costs for loss of/damage to vehicle keys and 
documents.

 Vehicle theft protection with refund of the excess.

 Reimbursement of damage and theft of car radio and 
navigation system (mobile or built-in) in connection with 
burglary damage.

 Refund of damage processing charge.

 Customary liability coverage.

 Additional liability insurance in the amount of EUR 7.5 million.

 All local taxes.

 Airport fees.

 The fuel policy: Return as pick up, usually this is "full-full".

 Changes to the reservation are possible at any time before the 
rental date.

 Payment 14 days before the rental date at the earliest (in the 
Netherlands, France and Belgium 4 weeks before the rental).

 Buyer protection 
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FURTHER ADVANTAGES OF 
BOOKING AT SUNNY CARS

 Easy booking via ATRIIS GTP

 Comprehensive services without deductibles, which exceed 
the classic insurance standards. This means no expensive 
additional insurances at the pick-up and no hidden costs.

 With the additional services, such as fast lane, a guaranteed 
"young car", no deposit or online check-in, the appropriate 
all-inclusive package can be booked together and is billed as 
complete price.

 The travel expense accounting is simplified, as all important 
services are already included in the total price due to 
transparent rental conditions.

 As Sunny Cars cooperates with various rental companies in 
the destination areas, you have a varied choice for your car 
rental with a unified service package.

 Full flexibility thanks to free cancellation protection and the 
possibility to change your booking free of charge until shortly 
before the start of the rental.

 Uncomplicated sending of documents via e-mail and using 
mobile vouchers (Apple Wallet).

 Special conditions for long term rentals can be arranged 
individually.
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